Bid Tabulation Event #2750 Demolition & Debris Removal, Kmart Site Bid Opening Date: 10/10/2023 Buyer Name: Duane Hansen

Bidder Name	Description	Total Cost
	Demolition, Debris Removal and Site Preparation for 10 West Lake Street	
LinnCo, Inc.	(Former Kmart site) as per Bid documents. Enter total project bid price here:	\$1,137,000.00
	Line intentionally added with no bid item. Bidder should check the "no bid" box	
LinnCo, Inc.	to bypass entering a price.	\$0.00
	Demolition, Debris Removal and Site Preparation for 10 West Lake Street	
KEVITT EXCAVATING, LLC	(Former Kmart site) as per Bid documents. Enter total project bid price here:	\$742,000.00
	Line intentionally added with no bid item. Bidder should check the "no bid" box	, ,
KEVITT EXCAVATING, LLC	to bypass entering a price.	\$0.00
	Demolition, Debris Removal and Site Preparation for 10 West Lake Street	
	(Former Kmart site) as per Bid documents. Enter total project bid price here:	\$662 260 00
VEIT AND COMPANY, INC.	Line intentionally added with no bid item. Bidder should check the "no bid" box	\$662,360.00
		¢0.00
VEIT AND COMPANY, INC.	to bypass entering a price.	\$0.00
	Demolition, Debris Removal and Site Preparation for 10 West Lake Street	
FRATTALONE COMPANIES,	(Former Kmart site) as per Bid documents. Enter total project bid price here:	\$887,138.00
	Line intentionally added with no bid item. Bidder should check the "no bid" box	
FRATTALONE COMPANIES,	to bypass entering a price.	\$0.00
	Demolition, Debris Removal and Site Preparation for 10 West Lake Street	
RAMSEY EXCAVATING CON	(Former Kmart site) as per Bid documents. Enter total project bid price here:	\$1,299,000.00
	Line intentionally added with no bid item. Bidder should check the "no bid" box	+_,,
RAMSEY EXCAVATING CON	to bypass entering a price.	\$0.00
		, .
	Demolition, Debris Removal and Site Preparation for 10 West Lake Street	
RACHEL CONTRACTING LLC	(Former Kmart site) as per Bid documents. Enter total project bid price here:	\$638,667.00
	Line intentionally added with no bid item. Bidder should check the "no bid" box	, ,
RACHEL CONTRACTING LL	to bypass entering a price.	\$0.00
	Demolition, Debris Removal and Site Preparation for 10 West Lake Street	4
G. URBAN COMPANIES, IN	(Former Kmart site) as per Bid documents. Enter total project bid price here:	\$1,084,000.00
	Line intentionally added with no bid item. Bidder should check the "no bid" box	
G. URBAN COMPANIES, IN	Qto bypass entering a price.	\$0.00